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On November 10, 2014, STEVEN R. SHRIDER, age 26 of Palmer, reported 
the theft of a flat screen television. 
 
On November 10, 2014, a 40 year old male from Palmer was arrested for 
Domestic Violence Assault 4th.  He was remanded to Mat Su Pre Trial 
without bail. 
 
On November 10, 2014, MATTHEW S. SIDRANSKY, age 32 of Anchorage, 
was arrested on a $5,000 warrant issued for Failure to Appear at a Change 
of Plea Hearing.  The original charge was Misconduct Involving a Controlled 
Substance in the Fourth Degree. 
 
On November 11, 2014, TORY J. MAUL, age 45 of Anchorage, was arrested 
on a $2500.00 cash or corporate bail warrant for Failure to Appear to 
Arraignment for Conference Hearing with the original charge of Issuing a 
Bad Check. 
 
On November 12, 2014, CAROL A. KLINGBEIL, age 63 of Palmer, was 
arrested on two $500.00 cash or corporate bail warrants for Criminal 
Trespass in the First Degree and Criminal Mischief in the 5th Degree 
 
On November 12, 2014, Palmer Police arrested ASHLEY B. HILTON, age 19 
of Wasilla, on a $5,000 warrant issued for original charges of Theft in the 
Second Degree, Theft in the Third Degree, and Unauthorized Use of an 
Access Device. 
 
On November 12, 2014, JOSHUA M. Floyd, age 30 of Palmer, died from a 
self inflicted gunshot wound.  His next of kin have been notified. 
 
On November 12, 2014, DAVID C. RUSSNAK, age 28 of Wasilla, was 
arrested on a $250.00 cash or corporate bail warrant for Theft in the Third 
Degree. 
 



On November 13, 2014, SHARON R. DWYER, age 59 of Palmer, reported a 
dog belonging to LINDA A. PEARSON, age 70 of Palmer, was bitten by a 
dog belonging to JONI K. HURST, age 59 of Palmer. 
 
On November 14, 2014, JACOB OWENS, age 19 of Palmer, turned himself 
in on a $2500 warrant on the original charge of Burglary I, Theft II, and 
Misconduct Involving a Controlled Substance IV. 
 
On November 13, 2014, MARY T. OLSON, age 26 of Palmer, was arrested 
for Disorderly Conduct.  She was remanded to Mat Su Pretrial to be 
released on her own recognizance when sober, per the bail schedule. 
 
On November 14, 2014, GIDEON Y. LEE, age 28 of Eagle River, was 
arrested for Disorderly Conduct. 
 
On November 15, 2014, Palmer Police issued a summons to a 16 year old 
male Palmer resident for Driving Without a Valid Operator’s License. 
 
 


